
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-6037

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
FOR: Brooms, Brushes and Accessories

TIME & (May 1, 2014 through May 31, 2015)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 27, 2014

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 BROOMS, BRUSHES AND ACCESSORIES

BROOM, HOUSEHOLD (SAWS #9932) Price each 3.95 6.13 3.93

Size: 5 SEW X 56" Handle Total 426.60 662.04 424.44

Material:  Corn Bristles Size  55" Greenwood #561

1. Estimated Qty: 108 each per year Material  Corn Corn

BROOM, MEDIUM SWEEP (SAWS #9933) Price each 12.50 12.34 9.98

Size: 24 inches Total 600.00 592.32 479.04

Material: Tampico Bristles Size  24" Greenwood #907

2. Estimated Qty:  48 each per year Material  Tampico Tampico

BROOM, PUSH Street (SAWS #9934) Price per box 39.00 96.80 38.94

Size:  16 inches Total 2,340.00 5,808.00 2,336.40

3. Material:  Plastic or Fiber Size  16" Greenwood #940

Estimated Qty:  60 boxes per year Material  Palmyran stalk Plastic

BROOM, ANGLED RUBBERMAID (SAWS #33743) 18.50 6.34 15.89

Size: 48 inch Price each 740.00 253.60 635.60

Material: Aluminum handle Polyproplene Bristles Total  48" 48"

Mfg: Rubbermaid 6385 Gray (equal or better) Size  Plastic Polyprop.

4. Estimated Qty: 40 each per year Material    

BRUSH APPLICATOR USED FOR BITURINE (SAWS #9939) Price per box 2.95 2.68  

Size: 6 inch length, 3 1/4 - 2 rows Total 35.40 32.16  

Material:  Wood handle bristle koppers tampico fiber Size  8.50% NO BID

5. Estimated Qty: 12 each per year Material  
WT-8 Odell Plastic handle

tampico fiber  

BRUSH SCRATCH WITH SCRAPPER WEILER CORP PART (SAWS #9966) Price per box 3.50 4.05 3.45

Size: 11 1/2 in Long wt = .60 lb. Total 252.00 291.60 248.40

Material:  Wood handle bristle wire Size  Same Weiler #L402000

6. Estimated Qty:  72 each per year Material  Wood and Steel  

HANDLE, TAPERED END (SAWS #13060) Price per each 3.25 3.76 3.13

Size:  1 1/8" Thick x 60 Inches long Total 1,482.00 1,714.56 1,427.28

Material:  Hardwood Grain Size  Same ABCO #01113

7. Estimated Qty: 456 each per year Material  Same  

HANDLE, SCREW END (SAWS #13051) Price per each 4.25 3.92 3.79

Size:  1 1/8" Thick x 60 Inches long Total 1,224.00 1,128.96 1,091.52

Material: Hardwood Grain Size  Same ABCO #01121

8. Estimated Qty:  288 each per year Material  Same  

LOBBY UPRIGHT DUST PAN RUBBERMAID RCP 2531 (SAWS #26312) Price per each 18.50 7.50 15.15

Size:  Total 203.50 82.50 166.65

Material:  Plastic   Size  Same Rubbermaid #2531

9. Estimated Qty:  11 each per year Material  Plastic  
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS
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BRUSH, DIAL SCRUB (SAWS #9967) Price per each 21.00 30.72 20.88

Size: 3 IN Wide 8 1/2 inch long w/handle Total 1,218.00 1,781.76 1,211.04

Material: Wood Handle, Palmyra Bristle Size  Same Wilen #I304008

10. Estimated Qty:  58 each per year Material  Same Palmyra

BRUSH, DECK (SAWS #9941) Price per each 30.00 36.48 29.88

Size: 10 inch  Total 30.00 36.48 29.88

Material:  Palymra Bristle Size   Greenwood #273

11. Estimated Qty:  1 case per year Material  Same Palymra

BRUSH FOUNTAIN WASHING BRUSH (SAWS #9949) Price per each 9.75 20.21 9.59

Size:  9 in Block, 3 in Trim with bumper Total 1,170.00 2,425.20 1,150.80

Material:  100% polished tampico Size  10" Magnolia #161

12. Estimated Qty:  120 each per year Material  Same Tampico

BRUSH, ALGAE POOL (SAWS #9937) Price per each 201.00   

Size: 9 inch Total 2,814.00 NO BID NO BID

Material: Stainless Steel Bristles Size    

13. Estimated Qty:  14 boxes per year Material    

BRUSH SCRATCH MINI WIRE HANDLE CURVED PLASTIC (SAWS #9965) Price per each 0.95 0.58 0.94

Size: Trim 1/2 inch row 3x4 bristle Total 45.60 27.84 45.12

Material:  Stainless Steel Bristles Size   Wilen #L407324

14. Estimated Qty:  48 each per year Material  Same SS

BRUSH SCRATCH (SAWS #9964) Price per each 2.25 0.58  

Size: 6 inch length, 1 1/8 inch row 3x19 Total 108.00 27.84  

Material: Wire Steel Size   NO BID

15. Estimated Qty:  48 each per year Material  Same  

SQUEEGEE FLOOR STRAIGHT BLADE UNDER FH900 (SAWS #16172) Price per each 19.95 24.16 19.92

Size:  36 inch Total 79.80 96.64 79.68

Material: Aluminum Size   Unger #FH900

16. Estimated Qty:  4 each per year Material  Same  

SQUEEGEE FLOOR STRAIGHT BLADE UNGER FH600 (SAWS #16171) Price per each 16.50 13.50 19.69

Size: 24 inch Total 132.00 108.00 157.52

Material:  Aluminum Size   Unger #FH600

17. Estimated Qty:  8 each per year Material  Same  

SPRAYER THREE GALLON (SAWS #16133) Price per each 32.20 54.93 27.98

FOR HERBICIDES AND INSECTICIDES HUDSON 90183 Total 2,447.20 4,174.68 2,126.48

Size:  Size   RL Flowmaster

Material:  Material  Same #1993A

18. Estimated Qty:  76 each per year     

BRUSH FLOOR DECK MULTI-LEVEL WITH PLASTIC BASE Price per each 6.95 6.55 6.99

ROW 7X14 (SAWS #9947) Total 83.40 78.60 83.88

Size:  10 inch Size ABCO #BA16006

Material:  With plastic base Material Same  

19. Estimated Qty:  12 each per year  

HANDLE TELESCOPIC RAINBOW NC9231276 (SAWS #13061) Price per each 31.95 56.76 51.95

Size:  8-16 ft Total 1,533.60 2,724.48 2,493.60

Material:  Size 8-18 ft Centinental #2550-18

20. Estimated Qty:  48 each per year Material Aluminum  

* ** **

TOTAL TOTAL 16,965.10 22,047.26 14,187.33
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EXTENSION 1 16,965.10

EXTENSION 2 16,965.10

EXTENSION 2 16,965.10

2% Net Net

Terms 20 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 7 days 15 days
  
 

 *LOW BIDDER
**BIDDER DID NOT BID 2 OR LESS ITEMS PRICING SHOWN FOR COMPARISON

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Public Facilities & Services, Inc. Lone Star Brush Co.
Abatix Corp. Matera Paper Co.
Action Time USA Millennium Dist.
Bon Tool Co. MSC Industrial Supply

Greenworld Market Broom, Brush & Mop Co. Pyramid School Products

Gulf Coast Paper Sunshine Distributors

Demandstar

SAWS Website

3


